
Technical Part A Part B Part B Part C
Score Lump Sum Price Days Value # of Bridges

Hill Brothers Construction Co., Inc. 82.13 No Bid 451 NO BID 2

Joe McGee Construction Co., Inc. 79.12 $9,999,999.00 421 $1,473,500.00 4

Key, LLC 88.17 $9,995,000.00 385 $1,347,500.00 2

Tanner Construction Co., Inc. 85.11 $9,990,000.00 451 $1,578,500.00 3

T.L. Wallace Construction Co., Inc. 81.98 $9,950,000.00 450 $1,575,000.00 2

5 5 5 5

Proposal Value
Hill Brothers Construction Co., Inc. NO BID

Joe McGee Construction Co., Inc. 1,939,202.21 ***Apparent Best Value Proposer

Key, LLC 6,027,794.02

Tanner Construction Co., Inc. 4,088,649.99

MDOT Project No. IM-0059-03(090)/105448301000
Design Build Proposal for I-59/I-20 in Lauderdale & Newton Counties



Part C
Value

NO BID

$8,000,000.00

$0.00

$4,000,000.00

$0.00

5


